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From one of our most beloved authors, a fascinating excursion into the history behind the place we call
home—now richly illustrated with more than three hundred images.

National bestseller At Home is Bill Bryson’s epic chronicle of domestic history. In this handsome new
edition, his riveting room-by-room journey of discovery around his house—a Victorian parsonage in
southern England—is enhanced by more than three hundred carefully curated illustrations, the large majority
of them in full color. As he did in the hugely successful A Short History of Nearly Everything: Illustrated
Edition, Bryson complements his sparkling prose with striking illustrations selected from a wide array of
sources to create a feast for the eyes as well as the mind. He has one of the liveliest, most inquisitive brains
on the planet, and he is a master at turning the seemingly mundane into an occasion for the most diverting
exposition imaginable. When you’ve finished this book, you will see your house—and your daily life—in a
new and revelatory light.
     In Bill Bryson’s hands, the bathroom provides the occasion for the history of hygiene; the bedroom for an
account of sex, death, and sleep; the kitchen for a discussion of nutrition and the spice trade. From
architecture to electricity, from food preservation to epidemics, from the telephone to the Eiffel Tower, from
crinolines to toilets—and the brilliant, creative, and often eccentric minds behind them—Bryson
demonstrates that whatever happens in the world ends up in our houses, in the paint and the pipes and the
pillows and every item of furniture.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Hester:

Here thing why that At Home: Special Illustrated Edition: A Short History of Private Life are different and
trustworthy to be yours. First of all examining a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of the usb
ports which is the content is as delightful as food or not. At Home: Special Illustrated Edition: A Short
History of Private Life giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any e-book out there
but there is no reserve that similar with At Home: Special Illustrated Edition: A Short History of Private Life.
It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing in which happened in the
world which is perhaps can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in playground,
café, or even in your way home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book
maybe the form of At Home: Special Illustrated Edition: A Short History of Private Life in e-book can be
your alternate.

Erma Ward:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book mainly book entitled At
Home: Special Illustrated Edition: A Short History of Private Life your brain will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely will become your mind friends.
Imaging just about every word written in a guide then become one contact form conclusion and explanation
in which maybe you never get before. The At Home: Special Illustrated Edition: A Short History of Private
Life giving you yet another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful data
for your better life in this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern the following is your body
and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a. Do you want to try this
extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Bethany Archie:

You are able to spend your free time to read this book this guide. This At Home: Special Illustrated Edition:
A Short History of Private Life is simple to deliver you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train
as well as soon. If you did not get much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the particular e-
book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. Therefore
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Tina Wilson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or to make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's heart or real their
pastime. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know



that on this time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this At Home: Special Illustrated Edition: A Short History of Private Life can
make you truly feel more interested to read.
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