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A Spark Of Desire...

Fine and fearless, Justus Robinson doesn't hesitate to hit on gorgeous law student Angela Dennis at his
brother's wedding even though she's the bride's sister. That night the two share an unforgettably sexy dance,
but nothing more--until ten years later when a tragedy reunites them...

...A Test Of Love

Angela has barely healed from a breakup when her sister and brother-in-law are killed in an accident.
Sharing their grief, Justus and Angela discover they are still attracted to one another. But when they find
themselves competing to adopt their orphaned young niece, their rekindled passion is sorely tested. Justus is
determined to raise the child even if it means alienating the woman he's never stopped wanting. Reeling from
loss and tormented by her desire for Justus, Angela makes a drastic move--one that will change the lives of
everyone involved...
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From reader reviews:

Bettina Cutler:

The book Risk will bring someone to the new experience of reading any book. The author style to spell out
the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to study, this book very appropriate to you. The
book Risk is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-book from your official web
site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Russell Carson:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon.
You will observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is Risk this guide consist a lot of the information in the condition of this
world now. That book was represented how does the world has grown up. The words styles that writer value
to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some exploration when he makes this book. This is
why this book ideal all of you.

Alice Black:

Beside this particular Risk in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh through the oven so don't
be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Risk because
this book offers to you readable information. Do you often have book but you would not get what it's facts
concerning. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable set up here
cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the item? Find this
book and read it from right now!

Larry Boggs:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Risk can be the response, oh how comes? A
book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand new era
is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?
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