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Anyone who recruits talent faces the same basic challenge, whether we work for a big company, a new start-
up, a Hollywood studio, a hospital, or the Green Berets. We all wonder how to tell the really outstanding
prospects from the ones who look great on paper but then fail on the job. Or, equally important, how to spot
the ones who don’t look so good on paper but might still deliver extraordinary performance. In a tough
economy, it’s more important than ever to make every talent decision count.

George Anders sought out the world’s savviest talent judges to see what they do differently from the rest of
us. He reveals how the U.S. Army finds soldiers with the character to be in Special Forces without asking
them to fire a single bullet. He takes us to an elite basketball tournament where the best scouts are watching
the players who don’t have the ball. He talks to researchers who are reinventing the process of hiring Fortune
500 CEOs.

Anders reveals powerful ideas you can apply to your own hiring. And in a new chapter for the paperback,
“Becoming a Rare Find,” he explains how to flip these strategies and make sure your talent isn’t missed.
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From reader reviews:

Alfred Cox:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading. Yep, by
reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand than other is high. For yourself
who want to start reading the book, we give you this The Rare Find: How Great Talent Stands Out book as
basic and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Shannon Grant:

Here thing why this particular The Rare Find: How Great Talent Stands Out are different and reputable to be
yours. First of all studying a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content than it which is the content is
as tasty as food or not. The Rare Find: How Great Talent Stands Out giving you information deeper since
different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no guide that similar with The Rare Find: How
Great Talent Stands Out. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your eyes about the thing that will
happened in the world which is might be can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in
recreation area, café, or even in your technique home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in
bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of The Rare Find: How Great Talent Stands Out in e-book can
be your substitute.

Mitchell Boone:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Rare Find: How Great Talent Stands Out
can be the response, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your spare
time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Jere Bingham:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but also novel and The Rare Find: How Great Talent Stands Out or
others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel need
to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or even students especially. Those ebooks are
helping them to bring their knowledge. In different case, beside science publication, any other book likes The
Rare Find: How Great Talent Stands Out to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book
like this one.
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