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Wrestling as a legitimate contest is one of the oldest, if not the oldest form of sport. There are cave drawings
in France that depict memorable matches, which are over 15,000 years old. Egyptian and Babylonian reliefs
depict wrestling bouts where wrestlers are using most of the holds known to the modern-day sport. Wrestling
was also a big part of ancient Greek literature and legend and historical records of sport indicate that
wrestling under various sets of rules was contested at the Ancient Olympic Games in Greece. Today’s
modern wrestling is a form of "sports entertainment" in which highly skilled athletes enact wrestling matches
in such a way so that their opponents do not get hurt and the matches' endings are scripted (although the
audience is not aware of the script).

This Historical Dictionary of Wrestling covers the history of Wrestling through a chronology, an
introductory essay, appendixes, and an extensive bibliography. The dictionary section has over 600 cross-
referenced entries on important amateur and professional wrestling, wrestling personalities, announcers,
managers and promoters from all eras, and wrestling organizations. This book is an excellent access point for
students, researchers, and anyone wanting to know more about the sport of Wrestling.
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From reader reviews:

Susan Arnold:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information these days can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even an issue. What people must be consider any time those
information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking seriously
which one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Historical Dictionary of Wrestling (Historical
Dictionaries of Sports) as the daily resource information.

Brad Hawkes:

The book untitled Historical Dictionary of Wrestling (Historical Dictionaries of Sports) contain a lot of
information on this. The writer explains your ex idea with easy means. The language is very easy to
understand all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was compiled by
famous author. The author gives you in the new time of literary works. You can read this book because you
can continue reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site and also
order it. Have a nice go through.

Susan Romero:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make someone
to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information quicker to share.
You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can see that
now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended to you is
Historical Dictionary of Wrestling (Historical Dictionaries of Sports) this guide consist a lot of the
information on the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has
grown up. The dialect styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made
some investigation when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book ideal all of you.

Patsy Kuster:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
think reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay you can have
the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Historical Dictionary of
Wrestling (Historical Dictionaries of Sports) which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this
book? Let's see.
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