
Medical-Surgical Nursing Demystified
(Demystified Nursing)

Mary Digiulio, James Keogh

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0071494502
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0071494502
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0071494502


Medical-Surgical Nursing Demystified (Demystified Nursing)

Mary Digiulio, James Keogh

Medical-Surgical Nursing Demystified (Demystified Nursing) Mary Digiulio, James Keogh

The painless way to master medical-surgical nursing

Medical-Surgical Nursing Demystified is a self-teaching guide and subject review that helps students and
practitioners understand the fundamental concepts of medical-surgical nursing. Using a building block
approach, this entertaining book breaks complex material down into brief, easy-to-understand sections.

Medical-Surgical Nursing Demystified features a full chapter for each system--cardiovascular, respiratory,
immune, hematologic, nervous, musculoskeletal, gastrointestinal, endocrine, genitourinary, and
integumentary. You'll find a description of how the system functions, signs and symptoms of diseases and
conditions, diagnostic tests, and treatment options. Perioperative preparation and pain management are also
covered. Filled with key terms to help you to remember important concepts, and complete with end-of-
chapter NCLEX-style quizzes to test your knowledge, this book will teach you the fundamentals of medical-
surgical nursing in no time at all.

This fast and easy guide offers:

Learning objectives at the beginning of each chapter●

An NCLEX-style quiz at the end of each chapter to reinforce learning and pinpoint weaknesses●

Coverage of diagnostic tests and treatment options●

A final exam at the end of the book●

A time-saving approach to performing better on an exam or at work●

Simple enough for a beginner, but challenging enough for an advanced student, Medical-Surgical Nursing
Demystified is your shortcut to mastering this essential nursing topic.
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From reader reviews:

Jaime Worm:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or this for all people in the world,
what best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has diverse
personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Medical-Surgical Nursing
Demystified (Demystified Nursing). All type of book could you see on many options. You can look for the
internet sources or other social media.

George Hardy:

The guide with title Medical-Surgical Nursing Demystified (Demystified Nursing) has a lot of information
that you can learn it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This kind of book exist new know-how
the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to
yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you within new era of
the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you
want.

Jennifer Pittman:

Often the book Medical-Surgical Nursing Demystified (Demystified Nursing) has a lot of information on it.
So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very
famous author. Tom makes some research just before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read
you may get the point easily after reading this article book.

Annette Spafford:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to examine a book. When you read a book
you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, since
book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that
you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, in addition to
soon. The Medical-Surgical Nursing Demystified (Demystified Nursing) will give you a new experience in
reading a book.
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