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Professional Penetration Testing walks you through the entire process of setting up and running a pen test
lab. Penetration testing-the act of testing a computer network to find security vulnerabilities before they are
maliciously exploited-is a crucial component of information security in any organization. With this book,
you will find out how to turn hacking skills into a professional career. Chapters cover planning, metrics, and
methodologies; the details of running a pen test, including identifying and verifying vulnerabilities; and
archiving, reporting and management practices.

Author Thomas Wilhelm has delivered penetration testing training to countless security professionals, and
now through the pages of this book you can benefit from his years of experience as a professional
penetration tester and educator. After reading this book, you will be able to create a personal penetration test
lab that can deal with real-world vulnerability scenarios.

All disc-based content for this title is now available on the Web.

Find out how to turn hacking and pen testing skills into a professional career●

Understand how to conduct controlled attacks on a network through real-world examples of vulnerable and●

exploitable servers
Master project management skills necessary for running a formal penetration test and setting up a●

professional ethical hacking business
Discover metrics and reporting methodologies that provide experience crucial to a professional penetration●

tester
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From reader reviews:

Ann Tuttle:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Sure, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own
spare time to take a wander, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book
entitled Professional Penetration Testing: Creating and Learning in a Hacking Lab? Maybe it is for being
best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can wiser
than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have other opinion?

Howard Joyce:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not involve people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a book
can help people out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Professional Penetration Testing:
Creating and Learning in a Hacking Lab book because book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course
the data in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Sandra Black:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may have
it in e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This particular Professional Penetration Testing: Creating
and Learning in a Hacking Lab can give you a lot of close friends because by you taking a look at this one
book you have factor that they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. This particular book
can be one of one step for you to get success. This book offer you information that probably your friend
doesn't know, by knowing more than some other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let us
have Professional Penetration Testing: Creating and Learning in a Hacking Lab.

Douglas Brownlee:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book but also novel and Professional Penetration Testing: Creating and Learning
in a Hacking Lab or even others sources were given information for you. After you know how the great a
book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or students
especially. Those books are helping them to put their knowledge. In various other case, beside science guide,
any other book likes Professional Penetration Testing: Creating and Learning in a Hacking Lab to make your
spare time more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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