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In his classic study The Masks of God, Joseph Campbell conducted us on a fascinating global tour, showing
how the seeds of myth grew in a similar fashion throughout the history of civilization. Before Campbell there
was Sir James George Frazier who, in The Golden Bough--his pioneering study of magic, relgion, and folk
custom--demonstrated how world mythologies exhibit "the effect of similar causes acting alike on the similar
constitution of the human mind in different countries and under different skies." Now, in Beyond the Blue
Horizon, eminent astronomer E.C. Krupp guides us expertly through a bewildering maze of cultures and
civilizations--from the stone age to the present day--making clear that while the skies of these diverse
peoples may vary, they speak nearly the same language.
Beyond the Blue Horizon is a treasure trove of myths, legends, and stories in which people have, through the
ages, attempted to understand the cosmos and its meaning for humankind. Collecting an astonishing amount
of lore between the covers of a single book, Krupp explains why our ancestors were so intrigued by the
heavens, and what their celestial stories meant. Readers will learn, for example, that many cultures saw a
rabbit--rather than a man--in the moon, and that this moon-rabbit, as a symbol of sacrifice and rebirth, is a
cousin of our own Easter Bunny; that to our ancestors, an eclipse challenged the stability and integrity of
heaven and thus threatened order and life on earth; that the magical sleighride and chimney antics of Santa
Claus echo the ancient journeys of shamans and witch doctors; that our "dog days" of July and August
originated in Roman times with the summer appearance of Sirius, the Dog Star; and that the contemporary
stories of UFOs reveal the mystery and meaning the sky still holds for us as we approach the twenty-first
century. Of course, there is much, much more that will delight and intrigue; even readers familiar with world
mythology will find plenty that is new and strange in Krupp's rich panorama.
An epic, authoritative, and cross-cultural exploration with over 150 illustrations, Beyond the Blue Horizon
tells how all civilizations searched the sky to understand to universe--and our own place in it.
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From reader reviews:

Alan Coleman:

The feeling that you get from Beyond the Blue Horizon: Myths and Legends of the Sun, Moon, Stars, and
Planets could be the more deep you digging the information that hide into the words the more you get serious
about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Beyond the Blue Horizon: Myths
and Legends of the Sun, Moon, Stars, and Planets giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article author
conveys their point in certain way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the item because the
author of this e-book is well-known enough. That book also makes your own vocabulary increase well.
Therefore it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available.
We highly recommend you for having this particular Beyond the Blue Horizon: Myths and Legends of the
Sun, Moon, Stars, and Planets instantly.

George Hale:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you
obtain the unstable resource then you understand it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage
for you. All those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Beyond the Blue Horizon: Myths and
Legends of the Sun, Moon, Stars, and Planets as the daily resource information.

William Holmes:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV,
or even playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that's look different you can
read a book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all day long to
reading a guide. The book Beyond the Blue Horizon: Myths and Legends of the Sun, Moon, Stars, and
Planets it is very good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These were enjoying
reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy often the e-book.
You can m0ore quickly to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book has
high quality.

Margaret Padua:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try issue that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Beyond the Blue Horizon:



Myths and Legends of the Sun, Moon, Stars, and Planets, you can enjoy both. It is very good combination
right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout fellas.
What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.
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