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In February 1972, President Nixon arrived in Beijing for what Chairman Mao Zedong called the "week that
changed the world." Using recently declassified sources from American, Chinese, European, and Soviet
archives, Chris Tudda's A Cold War Turning Point reveals new details about the relationship forged by the
Nixon administration and the Chinese government that dramatically altered the trajectory of the Cold War.

Between the years 1969 and 1972, Nixon's national security team actively fostered the U.S. rapprochement
with China. Tudda argues that Nixon, in bold opposition to the stance of his predecessors, recognized the
mutual benefits of repairing the Sino-U.S. relationship and was determined to establish a partnership with
China. Nixon believed that America's relative economic decline, its overextension abroad, and its desire to
create a more realistic international framework aligned with China's fear of Soviet military advancement and
its eagerness to join the international marketplace. In a contested but calculated move, Nixon gradually eased
trade and travel restrictions to China. Mao responded in kind, albeit slowly, by releasing prisoners, inviting
the U.S. ping-pong team to Beijing, and secretly hosting Secretary of State Henry Kissinger prior to Nixon's
momentous visit.

Set in the larger framework of international relations at the peak of the Vietnam War, A Cold War Turning
Point is the first book to use the Nixon tapes and Kissinger telephone conversations to illustrate the
complexity of early Sino-U.S. relations. Tudda's thorough and illuminating research provides a multi-
archival examination of this critical moment in twentieth-century international relations.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Harris:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with their story or
even their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write about the data
about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids,
there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their
expertise in writing, they also doing some research before they write with their book. One of them is this A
Cold War Turning Point: Nixon and China, 1969-1972.

Matthew Thompson:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the spare time or they will get
large amount of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra time, we
will say absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of
activity do you have when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will probably
unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your
spare time, the particular book you have read is usually A Cold War Turning Point: Nixon and China, 1969-
1972.

Tina Alley:

This A Cold War Turning Point: Nixon and China, 1969-1972 is great e-book for you because the content
that is full of information for you who also always deal with world and possess to make decision every
minute. This book reveal it info accurately using great manage word or we can state no rambling sentences
inside. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you
straight forward sentences but tricky core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having A Cold
War Turning Point: Nixon and China, 1969-1972 in your hand like finding the world in your arm, data in it
is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no e-book that offer you world with ten or fifteen tiny right but this
publication already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you
still doubt in which?

Neil McNatt:

This A Cold War Turning Point: Nixon and China, 1969-1972 is completely new way for you who has
interest to look for some information because it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you upon
it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having bit of digest in reading this A Cold War
Turning Point: Nixon and China, 1969-1972 can be the light food for you because the information inside this
particular book is easy to get through anyone. These books produce itself in the form which is reachable by



anyone, yes I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel tired even
dizzy this book is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a book especially this one. You can find
what you are looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book kind
for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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