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Sex, smoking, and social stratification are three very different social phenomena. And yet, argues sociologist
Randall Collins, they and much else in our social lives are driven by a common force: interaction rituals.
Interaction Ritual Chains is a major work of sociological theory that attempts to develop a "radical
microsociology." It proposes that successful rituals create symbols of group membership and pump up
individuals with emotional energy, while failed rituals drain emotional energy. Each person flows from
situation to situation, drawn to those interactions where their cultural capital gives them the best emotional
energy payoff. Thinking, too, can be explained by the internalization of conversations within the flow of
situations; individual selves are thoroughly and continually social, constructed from the outside in.

The first half of Interaction Ritual Chains is based on the classic analyses of Durkheim, Mead, and Goffman
and draws on micro-sociological research on conversation, bodily rhythms, emotions, and intellectual
creativity. The second half discusses how such activities as sex, smoking, and social stratification are shaped
by interaction ritual chains. For example, the book addresses the emotional and symbolic nature of sexual
exchanges of all sorts--from hand-holding to masturbation to sexual relationships with prostitutes--while
describing the interaction rituals they involve. This book will appeal not only to psychologists, sociologists,
and anthropologists, but to those in fields as diverse as human sexuality, religious studies, and literary
theory.
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From reader reviews:

Antonio Duncan:

This Interaction Ritual Chains (Princeton Studies in Cultural Sociology) usually are reliable for you who
want to be a successful person, why. The reason why of this Interaction Ritual Chains (Princeton Studies in
Cultural Sociology) can be among the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple
reading food but feed anyone with information that maybe will shock your previous knowledge. This book is
definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed ones.
Beside that this Interaction Ritual Chains (Princeton Studies in Cultural Sociology) giving you an enormous
of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your
day exercise. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Hilda Dumas:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
lots of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do you
try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the particular
book you have read is definitely Interaction Ritual Chains (Princeton Studies in Cultural Sociology).

Linda McGrane:

You could spend your free time to study this book this reserve. This Interaction Ritual Chains (Princeton
Studies in Cultural Sociology) is simple bringing you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and soon. If
you did not get much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make
you much easier to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of
benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Joseph Russell:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
most effective book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as of
book Interaction Ritual Chains (Princeton Studies in Cultural Sociology). You can contribute your
knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read.
It is most essential that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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